

CITY OF STAUNTON
UNOFFICIAL BID RESULTS
FUEL - J00318 - OCTOBER 19, 2018 - 2:00 P.M.

BID ITEM	CONTRACTOR			
	AUGUSTA PETROLEUM	PETROLEUM TRADERS	MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY	JAMES RIVER PETROLEUM
TANK WAGONS				
DIESEL		No Bid	No Bid	
MARK UP	0.1000			0.0450
FREIGHT	0.0550			0.0500
COMBINED	0.1550			0.0950
Lubrication Additive:				
Cost per	0.0200			0.0095
Brand	Ecoclean			Innospec 7725
Anti-Gel Additive:				
Cost per	0.1500			0.0095
Brand	CFI 1902			Innospec 8000C
UNLEADED		No Bid	No Bid	
MARK UP	0.1000			0.0400
FREIGHT	0.0960			0.0450
COMBINED	0.1960			0.0850
TRANSPORT TRUCKS				
UNLEADED				
MARK UP	0.0200	0.0040	0.0784	0.0100
FREIGHT	0.0500	0.0576	0.0000	0.0300
COMBINED	0.0700	0.0616	0.0784	0.0400
DIESEL				
MARK UP	0.0200	0.0060	0.0779	0.0050
FREIGHT	0.0550	0.0574	0.0000	0.0500
COMBINED	0.0750	0.0634	0.0779	0.0550
Biocide:				
Cost per		0.0250	0.0300	0.0300
Lubrication Additive			.	
Cost per	0.0200	0.0200	0.0300	0.0095
Brand	Ecoclean	Schaeffer	Arsenal	Innospec 7725
Anti-Gel Additive:				
Cost per	0.0150	0.0250	0.0250	0.0095
Brand	CFI 1902	Schaeffer	Arsenal	Innospec 8000C
TERMINAL	Richmond	Roanoke	Roanoke	Montvale

Apparent Low Bidder